
BCCGB Open Show 11/11/18  

 

Minor Puppy Dog (3,0) 

1st Oliver’s ARRODARE ROYAL APPROVAL 

Very raw 6 month old.  Level topline with good neck and well balanced head.  He has a correct tail 
set and moved well.  Will be nice to see him once fully mature.  Best Puppy Dog and RBPIS. 

2nd Porter’s KIRKWIND SHOOTING STAR 

Another very raw puppy who needs to mature.  Stronger in head than first place but still nicely 
balanced with well placed ears.  He needs to settle on the move.  Correct coat coming through well, 
another will be interested to see in the future. 

3rd Collins’ BORDADALE BLUE MARVEL 

 

Puppy Dog (6,0) 

1st Oliver’s ARRODARE ROYAL APPROVAL 

2nd Austin’s MIRAJE FROZEN AGAIN FOR HYSTEPS (ai) 

Very well presented young dog with good spring of rib and ample coat. Well balanced head with 
good stop and nice ears.  He moved well with a level topline and correct tail set. 

 

Junior Dog (1,0) 

1st Shahmatova’s NASHDOM PUTTING ON THE STYLE JW 

Nicely angulated with good topline and nice reach of neck.  Good dark eye with pleasant head and 
ample stop.  Correct coat although appeared to be dropping much of it.  He moved well but could be 
moved faster to show rear drive. 

 

Yearling Dog (2,0) 

1st Lee’s MASTER OF ILLUSION JW 

Overall a very sound dog with ample coat, good angulation and a level topline.  Nice masculine head 
showing good balance and a nice dark eye.  He was very well handled, however it would be 
interesting to see him moved a little faster. 

2nd Pollard’s JANBELL THE FORCE AWAKENS 

Another nice male, well presented but lacking slightly in body and spring of rib although this should 
come with maturity.  Slightly longer in loin but still well balanced with a smart outline.  Moved well 
but needs to run straighter. 

 



Graduate Dog (2,0) 

1st Austin’s MIRAJE FROZEN AGAIN FOR HYSTEPS (AI) 

2nd Kinton & Davis KINAWAY ALL IS SAID AND DONE FOR JACAMALIS JW 

This young male moved well but with slightly too much enthusiasm which made it hard for him to 
settle on the move.  He has a correct coat and nice topline with a good tail set. Longer in body than 
first place. 

 

Post Graduate Dog (5,0) 

1st Beaumont’s KANAMAREN TRICK OF THE TAIL AT BORDERBEAU JW 

This is a lovely male who I was pleased to award Best Dog and RBIS.  He is immaculately presented 
and showed extremely well with good enthusiasm.  He has a lovely head with a good reach of neck 
leading in to good front angulation and a level topline.  Nice spring of rib and enough loin with good 
angulation at the rear and a well turned stifle.  He showed ample drive and ground coverage whilst 
moving and was a pleasure to judge. 

2nd Walter’s GOYTRE HIDING MY HEART 

This is another nicely constructed male who moved well with good drive.  He has lovely angulation 
front and rear and a nice head with good reach of neck.  Just preferred overall head balance of first 
place. 

3rd Chandler’s RAZDA FAME AND FORTUNE 

 

Limit Dog (1,0) 

1st Barwick’s TOBERMORAY TALK OF THE TOWN JW 

Nicely put together male with ample body and length of loin. He moved well however needs to 
move faster in order to show more reach and ground coverage.  He is slightly squarer in outline and 
lacking a little in reach of neck.  He was today lacking in coat. 

 

Open Dog (8,2) 

1st Gregory’s TONKORY KING OF THE ROAD JW 

Very well handled, absolutely immaculately presented young dog.  Strong movement front and rear, 
level topline and a correct head with good dark eye, nice stop and good ear set.  Good angulation 
front and rear with lovely straight hocks. 

2nd Large’s SH CH WIZALAND SONGS FROM THE WOOD 

Extremely close call between first and second place. This is another well-constructed male this time 
of stronger type with good angulation, nice reach of neck and a good correct coat. He moved very 
well and showed good drive but I felt he needed to settle on the move.  It is a shame he came up 
against first place but they could very easily swap places. 



3rd Harlow’s SH CH SIMARO JAMES BOND JW (IMP DEU) 

 

Any Other Colour Than Black & White (3,1) 

1st Pollard’s ARNPRIORS HARVEST GOLD 

7 year old red with a nice coat of good quality and well presented.  He has a good topline with nice 
angulation and moved well with great enthusiasm.  Lovely straight hocks and well set tail.  He most 
certainly enjoyed his day out. 

2nd Knight’s DREAMWORK SHADES OF GREY 

This is a very overly excited blue merle who today was lacking in body and coat.  He was so 
enthusiastic that is was extremely hard to judge his movement.   Slightly lacking in front and rear 
angulation which prevents him from covering the ground well when he moves.  If more settled he 
would be easier to judge. 

 

Special Working Dog (3,1) 

1st Barwick’s TOBERMORAY TALK OF THE TOWN JW 

2nd Brierley’s GOYTRE FIRST EDITION P-BEG-EX 

This was a close call between first and second place and I think if moved faster the two could have 
swapped places.  He is a lovely male although I would prefer slightly more body which would assist 
him in looking a little more masculine.  His angulation was good, and he moved well coming and 
going. 

 

Veteran Dog (9,3) 

1st Carley, Ward & MacFarlane’s SH CH JUPAVIA SEVENTH HEAVEN JW SHCM 

Superbly presented and well handled mature dog who was full of enthusiasm.  He has a lovely 
outline with a balanced head, ample reach of neck and correct front angulation.  His topline is level 
on the stand and move, correct tail set and he covers ground well when he moves.  Pleased to award 
Reserve Best Dog, BVD and RBVIS. 

2nd Gowing’s WILDBLUE IT’S THE BUSINESS SHCM (IMP USA) 

This was another class where first and second could swap places.  Slightly smaller less heavy-set 
male with a super coat and in fabulous condition.  He moved very well and gave first place a good 
challenge. 

3rd Walter’s GOYTRE SMOKIN GUN 

 

Good Citizen Dog (3,1) 

1st Tansley’s BILYARA ICE MAIDEN 



Well angulated male with a nice correct coat and lovely tail set.  When he moved he showed great 
enthusiasm and a level topline.  He has a well balanced head with nice ear set, good dark eye and 
well placed ears.  He has ample coat of good quality. 

2nd Brierley’s BRAMBLESAZ AQUA FREEDOM P-BEG-EX 

This male was more delicate in type with less masculine head.  He was lacking in stop which made 
the head slightly less well balanced.  Level topline held throughout.  He moved well but needs to 
move in straighter lines to allow movement to be judged easier. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


